
,"

((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront."

(signature)

Name ~1err ~;ic. Address ;jYtfO IT/) t~rp~h)c. ;r..

ff)eftMtJa,,(VJY&-- 2-'1-yf!

G~~\ ~u9~\

~~



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Pleasevote "NOli on
rezoning the ~t _~n'

L,~

Address 3:.7~

(signature)

rl (~/'t{-



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CJTY COUNCJL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private

I develo t. Plea-se vote "NO" on
rfro

)

\eigna'ture)

Address ~ 3 t~. -; ilL



UDon't Rezone the Waterfront
To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

IIIam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, a~ opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rezonilng the waterfront. II

Y? . (signature)

Name13eol'e..-/yM. Attt""7Address ~2" N. P,'1t sfrc&. t'
fl {fl¥.~d.r..,. IIA- ;;2),.'1«';2. $"01J

PleasE~ call us and we willPICK UPyour card and
delivE'r it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
pleasl~ call:

6035129379

OR

7037327269



ltDon't Rezone the Waterfront

To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezon' g the w~er

,

fro t."
(

/..t; (signatu re)

Plea call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
pleasE' call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as oppose to private
commercial development. ease vote "NO" on
rezonin~~

.

n"
~tW0nt."

~~/t- (signature)

Nam~~@" ~~f',AddreSS3el' (J) Pod"'-c j /]7



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Pleasevote "NOli on
rezoning the waterfront. II

ay, v.e.t (signature)

Name Address

~ /frV 1YJ'-



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront
TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314-

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rezoning the waterfront.'1

.
'c .%"'~.,

'"~ 4i ~ (signature)

Name~JrAddress \:.sC'\ 'S S\.\..~\':i\fwt 8)'.;} , A<\\{J(:}<H"l) \.JA
::}~\l\

Please call us and we will PICK UP your card and

deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
cultur istory, as opposed to private

,mercial d e pm

B
nt. Plea

.

se vote "NO" on
t rfr t"

c..De-1-\..l
(signature)



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXi\NDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezon'n the waterfr nt."r--

(signature)



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rez ni the wate ~" <.':?

(signature)



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. PI~

.

Pie vote "NO" on
rezonin e waterfront," / /

(signature)

rtr;]~"'-V ~c ~1 Address 6/rJ)V' W,!-)j .J f-



/iDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"1am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial de)J'elopment. Please vote "NO" on
rezonin rfrqf1: 11

I I J (signature)

Na me .j I'N Y\\\t- Address~.:l_Ilj:JJDYl-') ~
~.l£~ 'L-t'101



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
re ning t e erf

(signature)

Namepd6 Address a J7 s ~ PAYJVe sr;
~/V" ;VO"'f

o.



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront
TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314-

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote II NOli on

rezoning t~e wa~ert ont.II';
~;;. - /)'v--. t:.~ (signature)

Name )~\"~I~lt~ ~\
()~~I ;A~dress IPJ { ~ 'k I"'e,( f

vf>fvtr 6~

Please call us and we will PICK UPyour card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

6035129379

OR

703 732 7269



UDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 5129379

OR

703 732 7269



{(Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

111 am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo e water: r t. II

(signature)

s. tJ~vJ~T1J).j ~(. . M
~k'N1>fl./ ft J V~ ",c/

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and <Z..-~SfV,
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

6035129379

OR

703 732 7269



HDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo!)J the w erf t."

..' ~
I / ,/f-/7 . ,,1£.:. (signature)

Name 1I;<.df (~e1t\o]d$Address '2)3C) L'Jvrl.f£..5+

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront
TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on artsl
culture and historYIas opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
re age w front.1I

(signature)

Nam~~ddress~Li.>.AbI~Jc.~J¥: ~3oJ- ,I
M~~(l 4 t \),A

Please call us and we will PICK UPyour card and Q)J-'Jl1
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your cardl
please call:

603 5129379

OR

703 732 7269



({Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"1am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts!
culture and history! as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo ingthe waterfront. II

(signature)

Name~\V\ ~Address \\\) ~\)\~\i)Y\ S~~~t. \J~
A ~LV\O'f \

q t
Please call us and we will PICK UP your card and

deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card!

please ca II:

603 5129379

OR

703 732 7269



HDon't Rezone the Waterfront

To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

"1am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINO" on
rezoni e terfront.1I

(-' (signature)

N
Tam

'i \; >'1S.(~ r'Y\.q ,'i,
ddress ./'

~J ;J r (' ~ r~

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

6035129379

OR

703 732 7269

s+



/lDon't Rezone the Waterfront

To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on

rez91J.ing.the wgJ:e~front."
i~-1 C~5S (signature)

Namea.l<h~j~''''''''\~ Address S~ S ~~N c:;:r

Please call us and we will PICK UPyour card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

6035129379

OR

703 732 7269



UDon't Rezone the Waterfront
To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts}
culture and history} as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezonin the waterfront."

E' :i
.L C hl().J13

Name /It
.

i~ C 71
.. '

Address
ex" V (onj'}e

Please call us and we will PICK UPyour card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card}
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269

S-f



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni t e rfront."

(signature)

Name \<o\xw+ Address (P~Wf~sk (€-,

\)\ (~v\. At5l.."'jl.,..,~l~,-iVA, 2'L ~Cc



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on artsJ
culture and historYJas opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the jJ
waterfront. II '.
_(signatur~

t'AtrtO:C-
Name eoi"-\J...o.-balJ.:¥,ddressr;U 5r ~ st.

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your cardJ
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



{(Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 223J4

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rezoning the
waterfront. II

_(signature)

Name ~ ~1)ff,t1~?Address~rt 7. ~~

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront."

(signature)

Name Address



({Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KJNG ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rez th wat rfr.

Name Address

~YV\)~ Ca. \Jwe~ I

(signature)
8-.

I



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND ClTY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfron

(signature)

Nam~; Address

''ZD'L ~V,L\ tJ hT



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 2.2314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the aterfro~t."().

W~I W ~ (signature)

~~~.tt ~D W ~t!v
k\ddress 5Dl Sl q.S-..e;y ~ L-o.- '"' e. if 1 ( ~

Ai €-'f- 2_'2 31 L-]



{{Don'tRezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture d history, as opposed to private
evelopment. Please vote "NO" on
w~terfront."

Address

(signature)

50 ( S 141~K5 LI/le tI /12/



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo i th~ w;~nt;." _

L--~ (signature)



((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Pleasevote "NOli on
rez "ng the waterf~on,t.", ",~. Ltcw db-- (signature)

Name o o~",; -e

LAv ""-~ & c"-

Address



{{Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront."

lr1AA ~.~
. lUo (signature)

Name MC"It~ ~t~\\~'J# Address 7 t'" S .LDo.sl: "\~'"
~+--

f:, - ~ l ~lLv. V~ '2-'L3 iY



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

f\LEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO"on
rezonig th water ront."

(signature)

:ddress1 i7) (l If
Jfby~ ;



ilDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and 'story, as 0 posed to private

I evelop t. Please vote "NO" on
e water 0 ("

Name

(Signaj?e)

<lAddress '12(..5 rrlf54



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 K1NG ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vo e "NO" on
rezoni g the!w erfro

NameCfJ~0
-r@j bof

(signature)

Add ress



((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

f\LEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the rfront."

(signature)



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rez ing the waterfront."

(signature)

WvA~1F;.~ &2III b

IN ~ir

~c~~~ ~(Q~

uk 2200£



{(Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CJTY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo in t.JJF waterfront."

t-L (signature)

Namel.~ \Sv.Alt Address~\"t. :tt~/7

>-5-~



HDonlt Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314.

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni g the waterfront: "f.

~ , . t!3f\AL/1\ (signature)

NameJIIVt}A prllJ6*' :52 9~.J..ee0rfrEet-



({Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRlf\ VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rez ng e waterfro t."

t-.-L (signature)

'-f2-1 I\JPfirR.f~r/d ress g tt<;.~£1C

-(~



lIOon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rez the waterfr

.A



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

30] KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the wat rfront."

/~
. .

(signature)



/lOon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING 51'

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront."

)...
.

(signature)

Address Ct t L (;A.NE-I,LoJJ ~~_

'2-1-.2>1i



((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA V A 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfron .

Name~A

(signature)

So-A ~tC;P( JJ ~

~?<, 2-2-111 ~3 35'#



itDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXi\NDRIA VA 22314

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rezo

. g the wat~rf nt.'

Name Address

~5M) P'(Jf-h6tvh

(signature)



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KfNG ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"1am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni the waterfront."

(signature)

Nam~lll?d";;p<bddress (d1J( h)j~ £-1



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial developme . Please vote "NO" on

ning-the wa r
(signature)

IYO'~~Ll5~ V2.Jj

kfaI/I CU/VYli /J/J1,-<.b'6
Address



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote" NO" on
rezonin the aterfro

f6 S.

(signature)



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-1 zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on rezoning the

waterfront. "

Name \MV\i1i{((~AddressJJ~ PVLrtCt Jt

(signature)



IlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, a opposed to private
com mer . I d op ent. Please vote "NO" on
rezonin II

(signature)

Name Jvhn Pt>M~;:tAddress 2l~ f ~ c.y-

IH~ V~ Z-2--")i7
I



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-l zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on rezoning the

waterfront. "

f1 . YJ 'f-~/' ~ -! ' ! Y'tfI ,J.!t.Nam~U(V/f. f I

dress

(signature)



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

30l KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314-

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-l zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on rezoning the

waterfront." .JulcE' 6fL01hfv\,~

t Ii'~. Address c;;LoLI /2 E. OAk' Sf-

2 23 () I

(signatu re)
---

//
/



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIAVA22314-

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-1 zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on rezoning the

waterfront. II

"\:)2.~ \ ~

Name1\\"\\i Address \0\ E. ~\l.- ~r
\J.-"f(A 0S~ {"~"'--' ~.f\- ~J \

j

',VJ\..J (signature)



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYORAND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIAVA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-1 zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on rezoning the

waterfront."

Name Jt'~" ~r~\, Address



"Don't Rezone the Waterfront!"

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront Agreement

that would allow hotels and to changes to the 1992 W-l zone

that would allow more density. I would prefer a waterfront

based on arts, culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO"on rezoning the

waterfront."

ignature)



ItDon't Rezone the Waterfront

To: Mayor and City Council

301 King St.

Alexandria VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
re?011}ngthe W(~Jerfr90J)

I 1/ i ..r..vr. ...

! _1/)
~ffV'Address

(signature)

1/'-( 7;>"JlfaA-i
Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

6035129379

OR

703 732 7269



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO"on
rez ing the wate ront."

Name
~ L-€.

Address /

~£L/NG-

.
ature)



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO"on
rezqfY:i:ng th~aterfront. II

L-'i Gz (signature)

Nam~/1 Address 5/'S &I/-e.-er-vSI-,. ~.A3(4-

Cv c{t---ldcttj



t/Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront. II

,
",~ ~ & (signature)



HDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

III am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote IINOIIon
rezoning the waterfront.1I

(signature)

Nam~~AddressJOt) Vl/O(FE S+



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"Iam opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO"on
rezoninwt~l} wa rfr .lle /,

~;1t(c _ ',- ';L!(~ (signature)

Name 0v lt6W. Le~ c6Y=

f{fef
,V{J.



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo 'i the waterfront."

vsTt-Lfvl ([



liDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront. II

(signature)

Name~Address \\(1) ')]\I(.~~ X



IlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the a rfro t."

Nam



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni t erfro

(signature)

Name ~-ltI-l6E]LI A"Address I ~ rnl1/lt?s eel:
Rt<N(



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

30] K]NG ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial de elopmetlt. Please vote "NO" on

.. A /
rezoningth. rfr nt."

/ ,! 1 (signature)



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezonin e waterfront. II

/
I ::::-

---=:5ignature)
(,) "-- -

. l11Jt Cu'/(/Address ~Dt S'. V.v r <?'V&.
(,

I f4(~y v,f



((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
comm i de

~.
e

.

lo

.

pment. Please vote "NO" on

rez in. . ront."
, /"- - (signature)

Nam~ \"'-",,0... Address ~
'"

A"..c.~

~\~~1- ) ,;~



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING 51'

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni the w terfr

ignature)

Name~~ess ~f~U)OLEt~
~le~~y- vJ\

2?-~ l1-f-



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would aI/ow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo I g th rfro.1I



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on

rez~ng~~/e w}.terffo~t
m

'"
VIA ~~vvr

"
V /Jlv 'r"""-- (signature)

Name BrOMM Address 5~q 5.51- A30--flc:sl-



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote" NO" on
rezonin waterfr~

(signature)

Address ~~O .Nv U'\MoVt ')( , ll1
Y

Please call us and we will PICK UP your card and

deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,

please ca 1/:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



llDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rez ni he waterfl:: nt"

(signature)

NameUt;/Jde Address5 .
uf, ~~~

1A411ft,M t/4
Please can us and We will PICKUPyour card and ~~ S-
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 2231+

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on

rez~
(signature)

Name {/..tAf~ ~~ddress
'4" C. ~Lf 6,1.of
AJ...fi)oDiJOIl4~ VA 1.2.~

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



tlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. Iwould prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni he aterfront."

(signature)
lL ~VA

Name~Address~~. .~,,"-'

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



((Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST.

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront."

J (signature)

Name GL.4/PJ: becu:Address S/~-WI L.J<&::s oS"

Please call us and we will PICKUP your card and
deliver it to the City Council for you.

To have a GAPA representative pick up your card,
please call:

603 512 9379

OR

703 732 7269



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfront." I, .. ~
J~y 13L.!) 4\")1> e \It. ~ ~~

Name o.ny ~"J)f¥~~ddress jr'::Y:> I <: l ~ J.A...s') }J

v::}L~ Y, ~JJ P J...,v\ J

J..'.l?O J



IIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezo

. g t wa rfront."

(signature)

AddressJ-l¥l ~ \-/~

, 2' tJ4~yfD~J Place

At e.-x 4'1'\cl v ; 11 ) VIf ')).3/1



IlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private

commercial development. Please vote "NO" on

r~zorin th,e waterfront."
/l:A.d.~ (signature)



IlDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the waterfron "

Q
(signature)

Name~Address I':OZ I't, iJ}.Jl(JN

n1ec.AA~



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezonl

(signature)

Name .AI. Fe\( Address /ciL Y ,;/ ~Ll!I ~ ~

a--~ 0, ~ ~--il/Y



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
re~ the wa(ettr~

~; . ~ (signature)

Name~5~ ~/f~ddress got{ <. ~ )7-

~ 1.//1- 2-2- ~/ Y



itDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
cult and history, as opposed to private

ercial developm nt. Please vote "NO" on
ing t wfertr. t."

I. .. (signature)

Name Address

J)/: ~J~~ (1. ~tte r-
ho; IJl1kAo 4-1

)2y l VA- LL3/Y
-



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changesto the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density, I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezon' g the waterfront."

(signature)

Name Address

~ (:) \ 0\Q~ ~t" ~r 6liJJlf

~Q/N14~ \fit



ItDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 223[4

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private

C

..

ommer ial develop

~
t. Pie vote "NO" on

r "n the w terfro ,II

,/

/ h ~ )rv signature

G-:Jb&1l ~
~ i~ COf\ ~~

Name Address

I'



{(Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial d velop~ent. Plea vote "NO" on
rezoning th ate fro

(signature)

Name e-o.~LI~iL!:'~ Address <lIb <: ;ZZ;Jt ~ S)
frt(~JJt (//!-

I :2~~J Y



/lDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

ALEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoning the ,;"aterfro~~1

v . ature)

Name Address

f1/l1/--~ IL &"k C S 9(ffLj;)~

/ O~-W~ )h~:;,

/
V~

l-2-~/



lIDon't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

301 KING ST

f\LEXANDRIA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes

to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,

culture and history, as opposed to private
c mmercial development. Please vote "NO" on
r zoning the water ont"

~.~

Jr:.. .

Name ...J ~
J

Address

(signature)

'i-/~ S', ~.JE
~~~I {j~

::>--:rJ / J-



{{Don't Rezone the Waterfront

TO: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

-301 KING ST

ALEXANDRlA VA 22314

"I am opposed to changes to the 1983 Waterfront
Agreement that would allow hotels and to changes
to the 1992 W-1 zone that would allow more
density. I would prefer a waterfront based on arts,
culture and history, as opposed to private
commercial development. Please vote "NO" on
rezoni the w t~ron

'
,

"

.

.
0 /(f (signature)

Name~.fkl Address

() t/-t1¥L )0 ~

U&0 ~Ot1.+h LArll'oY\. S-/.
f1-'~)(A~~;Cj vA-


